
A HOUSE DIVIDED: THE LANGUAGE

MOVEMENT IN POST-COLONIAL

KOREA AND THE RISE OF

PLURICENTRIC KOREAN

S P R I N G  2 0 2 1  
C K S  C O L L O Q U I U M  S E R I E S

After centuries of unification, the Korean
peninsula was arbitrarily divided in 1945, with
far-reaching ramifications. What has this
meant for the Korean language? In this talk
Pieper explores the indigenous Korean
language movement to promote Korean
language and writing under colonial
domination and the roots of a schism that
resulted in two rival factions of linguists.

FEB 24, WED, 
4:30PM 

VIA ZOOM

Daniel Pieper is a Lecturer in the East Asian
Languages and Literatures Department at
Washington University in St. Louis. He received
his PhD in Asian Studies from the University of
British Columbia. His current research focuses
on the emergence of Korean language
education as a discrete subject in turn-of-the-
century modern schools, the textual
differentiation process between cosmopolitan
Hanmun and vernacular Korean, and the role
of language ideology in directing language
reform and linguistic modernity.

Question?Please contact: KoreanStudies@stonybrook.edu  
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