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What does Islam have to offer health-care ethics
that cannot be found elsewhere? I do not mean to
suggest that there is only one answer to this ques-
tion, because there are many. However, I will focus
on the elevated status of the patient as the recipient
of compassionate care. Today, the primary medical

ethical issue is no longer a quandary such as “Should
we withdraw artificial nutrition and hydration from
a 90-year-old man with dementia?” Such questions
are, of course, important. However, the primary
issue is that the medical profession is losing its soul
to technology and dehumanized care in which
patients feel overbiologized and depersonalized,
nothing more than “the kidney in room 5.” I ask you
here today, in the name of Allah the merciful and
compassionate, to be the ones who provide leader-
ship in solving this crisis in medical care.  

Historians of medical ethics and bioethics rightly
begin with Hippocratic ethics (400-300 BCE). We are
familiar with the Hippocratic Oath and its influence.
One finds in the ancient Greeks and Romans
absolutely no passionate concern for the patient.
There is no sense that the Hippocratic physician
should go out of his way to help a needy patient. The
spirit of Greco-Roman medical ethics is more or less
casual with regard to the patient’s good. One has no
image of the physician who goes out of his way or
sacrifices ease in order to respond to the patient in
need. In fact, for all its strengths, the Hippocratic
ethos excludes from care slaves, poor people, and
dying patients. Certainly the oath is clear in pro-
hibiting the use of a deadly drug or abortifacient. It
affirms confidentiality and “do no harm” and has
many other strengths. But that passion for the
patient in need, no matter how inconvenient, is sim-
ply not part of the ethos. The Hippocratic tradition is
elitist, rather than devoted to patients in the spirit of
equal regard. It really operates at the level of medi-
cine as a career (careo) rather than anything deeper.
There is no real call to serve. 

Then comes the great period of the Judeo,
Christian, and Islamic traditions (est. 400 to 1750 CE).
Here the physician is no longer casual but rather
called by God to heal the sick regardless of their cir-
cumstances, degree of illness, or ability to pay. The
Islamic Code of Medical Ethics of 1981, ratified by the
First International Conference on Islamic Medicine
and endorsed by many Islamic countries, vividly
articulates this depth of calling to serve the needy.
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The physician swears to Allah to protect human life
in all stages and in any situation, doing his or her
“utmost to rescue it from death, malady, pain and
anxiety.” The physician protects dignity, and is “an
instrument of God’s mercy, extending my medical
care to near and far, virtuous and sinner, and friend
and enemy.”  This new depth of commitment to the
patient’s good is completely the product of Islam and
the other Abrahamic faiths. One finds a similar depth
of commitment in the oath and prayer of Musa ibn
Maymun (Maimonides), the great Jewish philoso-
pher and physician of Andalusia. Christianity started
Europe’s first hospitals and devoted entire commu-
nities of monks and nuns to the care of the ill.
Maimonides’ prayer includes “The eternal provi-
dence has appointed me to watch over the life and
health of Thy creatures.” Furthermore, “May the
love for my art actuate me at all times; may neither
avarice nor miserliness, nor thirst for glory of a great
reputation engage my mind; for the enemies of truth
and philanthropy could easily deceive me and make
me forgetful of my lofty aim of doing good to Thy
children.” This is entirely different in tone and pas-
sion for helping the needy patient from anything
that could possibly have been produced by the
Hippocratic tradition. 

So when we think of the Islamic tradition and the
other Abrahamic faiths, we have what is clearly the
most essential aspect of any medical ethics worthy of
the word, namely, the passion for the patient, the
willingness to serve selflessly as needed those whose
lives are imperiled. Elitism is replaced by servant-
hood and humility.

In the Enlightenment and beyond, we see a strict
rationalism and reliance on moral sentiments such
as sympathy. The passion for the patient is not lost,
but it is de-sacralized and removed from the context
of a sacred oath under one God. The God-centered
commitment to the patient’s good as the child of the
divine begins to erode.

In the modern phase (1960 to current), we see a
set of principles, now extended to include respect for
autonomy, but absolutely no framework from which
to affirm strong compassion for patients and a will-
ingness to set aside self in their interests with deep
commitment. I do not wish to claim that the princi-
ples of modern “bioethics” – respect for autonomy,
justice, beneficence, and nonmaleficence – are use-
less when it comes to the assessment of cases. But

they do not provide the power of passion and com-
passion, the sense of calling and vocation or the
appeal to self-denial that the Islamic tradition clear-
ly does. So what is the responsibility of Islamic med-
ical ethics today? It is the special role of Islamic med-
ical ethics to restore deep compassionate care and
patient-centeredness to the profession of medicine.
In Islamic medical ethics the patient comes first,
regardless of social status, poverty, or terminal ill-
ness.

The kind of care we are talking about requires
humility, empathic skills, and gratitude for the priv-
ilege of caring for the sick. In jeopardy in medicine
today is the human connection between doctor and
patient. There are doctors in training now who do
not want to do the physical examinations; they just
want to refer to a lab test or the echocardiogram on
a heart patient. If the health-care profession would
rediscover the power of human relationship we
could bring about the kinds of lifestyle changes that
would significantly reduce disease. Joe Martin, a
retired dean of Harvard Medical School, gave a talk
in which he talked about Joseph Michael Foley, a pre-
vious head of neurology and the residency director.
Joe Martin said Dr. Foley would take him and the
other residents into a patient’s room and without
fail, would appropriately put his hand on the hand or
the shoulder of a patient and would ask is there any-
thing he could do to make their hospital a little more
comfortable. Joe Martin said one patient, a woman,
took Dr. Foley up on his offer and asked for a good
cold iced tea, and Dr. Foley made sure somebody got
it for her. 

There will be a question about cost effectiveness.
When doctors are compassionate, the visits are not
more time consuming, with the possible exception of
palliative care because it deals with very complex
situations that actually can take several hours.  That
is why the issue of cost in palliative care is an impor-
tant one. In the ordinary clinical encounter, this is
not time consuming. In fact, it takes very little time
to simply sit on the edge of a bed and nicely ask a
patient how they are handling their illness and per-
haps if they need any special help from pastoral care.
Patients are more emotionally comfortable when
cared for in this way, and they are willing to divulge
information about themselves without the health-
care professional having to probe for it. Moreover,
you can get more efficient treatment planning and
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treatment adherence. A significant portion of every
American dollar spent on health care is spent
because people are not adhering to treatment and
not taking their medications — whether it is insulin
or immunosuppressants — they are not doing the
activities their physicians recommend, and they are
not following up. What is the single major factor that
contributes to adherence in patient response to
physician recommendations? It is compassionate
care. When patients feel that their doctor cares
about them, they will care about themselves. They
will take their medications, they will heal, and we
will have a much more cost-efficient system.

Dame Cicely Saunders started the first hospice in
the world. The word hospice came from the
medieval European culture. A hospice was a place
that was usually attached to a monastery or a church
where travelers and wayfarers would spend the
night. She used her analogical imagination to say
dying is a bit of a journey, and what people need is
hospitality. The notion of hospice was applied to
people who were dying.

If you look at the Islamic tradition, or look at the
Hebrew Bible, you will find that hospitality is a key
moral notion. People on the road, including the road
to death, are vulnerable. They require something
exceptional from us. Dame Cicely had to start St.
Christopher’s in the basement and board the win-
dows. The oncologists thought she was devilish.
People at that time in the late 1950s and the early
1960s thought that it was unconscionable to die
without a tube in every orifice, whether natural or
unnatural, but she fought that. Just like Florence
Nightingale, Cicely was a deeply committed
Anglican. She felt a divine calling in this work. In a
lot of ways, although we sometimes deny this reality,
people who do amazing things to help the needy
have this sense of God’s heart. 

In 1999, at a conference I ran at the
Massachusetts Institute of Technology (MIT) with
The John Templeton Foundation, she gave the din-
ner speech on empathy and compassionate love. She
said, “You know I am 83, and I cannot retire. I still go
into St. Christopher’s every morning, and I do a
menial task. I change bedpans for an hour, and I do it
as a spiritual practice. I may be an old woman, but
that is what I do.” She continued, “I sit on the end of
beds, and I just listen attentively in an undistracted
way to patients who are dying, because the most fun-

damental human need for someone who is dying, but
more generally, is to know that their lives are signif-
icant, that their lives matter, that their lives are
worth something, that their lives do not just rest on
some cosmic mistake.” She added: “The best way you
can convey that significance to people is to just be an
attentive listener.” So she did that. Then she said
“Oh. I would go on and later in the day get involved
in public relations and fundraising.” She combined
all those great spiritual emotions that I associate
with Islamic and other traditions: inner peace, tran-
quility, compassion, joy, a joy beyond happiness, a
joy that had an inner foundation. There was a sense
of depth in her presence that was really quite
remarkable.

So what can we do to recover the power of com-
passionate care in modern medicine? I think it is
essential that the Islamic medical societies be
involved not just on a theological basis, but also on a
scientific basis.

At hospitals across the country, Schwartz rounds
are conducted and do not focus on the biological sub-
strate but rather whether a patient was treated with
compassion and care and generosity. The Simulation
Center training programs are very important. We
work with students. We do not want them to simply
ask the patients, “What medications have you been
on? What is your medical history?” and so forth. We
want the students to ask a simple question such as,
“This must be pretty tough on you, yes?” “How are
you handling this and do you need some help?” or “It
is natural to feel pretty overwhelmed at times like
this.” We have whole sessions with our students in
the Simulation Center to encourage them to ask
these simple questions. A couple of months ago I was
up in the Catskills where the Hindu Medical
Association of America was having a retreat on com-
passionate care. About 700 physicians were there
because sometimes they just feel that the core of the
healing relationship, the compassionate care, is just
being pushed aside at their hospitals. They need to
occasionally get together and really firm up their
commitment to it because in the end that is really
what matters. If we are committed to this kind of
relationship, it will happen.

Lynn Halerman, who runs our palliative care pro-
gram at Stony Brook, has an interesting practice.
Before she enters the room of any patient she does
something called “Stop, knock, breathe.” Instead of
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barging into a room where a patient may be in the
corner of the bed naked, she stops, pauses, knocks,
breathes deeply in a kind of informal meditational
way, and then she listens for a response. This is an
example of the saying “There are no great works of
love; there are small things done with great love.”

The field of modern bioethics stressed respect for
patient autonomy. But it lost the richness of the
Islamic tradition and the other Abrahamic faiths
generally, in which caring for the patient regardless
of circumstances is the ultimate mark of a virtuous
doctor. 

My Muslim friends, who insist that all of God’s
children be treated equally with equal dignity and
care, today I call upon you to be the people who
bring compassionate care back into medicine, and to
bring your fellow physicians back into a domain of
generosity of soul and practice that alone can make
being a doctor gratifying and enduring. 

Let me reiterate. Medicine arose in theological
contexts. The ancients swore their healing oaths to
the gods and goddesses, thereby adding an aura of
sacred depth to the task of preserving life and ame-
liorating suffering. A revolution in medicine
occurred with the Abrahamic faiths, all of which
gave rise to a more deeply impassioned concern for
the ill than had been seen in classical antiquity. From
the Prayer of Maimonides to the Christian founding
of the first hospitals, from the advances made by
Muslim physicians to the establishment of great
medical schools in Europe and the Middle East, from
Florence Nightingale’s founding of modern nursing
to Dame Cicely Saunders’s establishment of the hos-
pice movement, from Albert Schweitzer’s “rever-
ence of life” to Paul Farmer’s “theology of libera-
tion,” good medical practice has never been secular-
ly grounded. Rather, medical science has been ener-
gized with the noble religious commitment to heal-
ing. Good healers have always understood that the
art of medicine requires empathic attentiveness to
patient spirituality. The patient who is loved feels
that his or her life has value and significance in the
eyes of the nurturer. Compassionate love responds
to the deepest of human needs: the need for signifi-
cance. It reflects back to the beloved the signifi-
cance, dignity, and even sacredness that would oth-
erwise be obscured. The need for significance is not
the quest for fame or renown. Rather, in navigating
through life, all people need to feel that their exis-

tence is not an error. The affirmation of significance
is profoundly important in times of severe illness. 

The great Abrahamic ideal of deep commitment
to patients in compassionate care and medical love is
the hope of the future. Muslim physicians could
organize a new era of commitment to the patient’s
good that comes from the very heart of Islam and is
a light to a profession where more professions have
no commitment to anything other than their own
comfort. Regrettably, too many physicians today are
little more than Hippocratic, and their deep loyalty
to the care of patients is diminished. We need a
renewed appreciation for the passion and compas-
sion for the patient, and here Islam is well posi-
tioned, along with Judaism and Christianity, to show
the way. 

The recovery of compassionate care is linked to
patient hope. Those who feel cared for with compas-
sion tend to be hopeful. The Islamic tradition ulti-
mately places all hope in Allah, so to relinquish hope
is to distrust the Creator. Most of us would agree that
“hope” is a “bigger” concept than optimism. Clinical
pastoral care brings perhaps the deepest perspective
on hope, and at its best, the most promise for reset-
ting the goals of hope. For each of us as finite beings,
the negotiation with hope ultimately raises ques-
tions of ultimate meaning and what can be broadly
considered matters of spirituality. There are many
patients for whom hope cannot be seriously dis-
cussed outside of a spiritual-religious tradition.

The word “hope” has been loosely drawn into the
art of healing from early on. Thomas Perceval, the
great Enlightenment physician, provided a code of
ethics that was reflected in the first American
Medical Association (AMA) Code of Ethics, in 1847, as
follows: “For the physician should be the minster of
hope and comfort to the sick…” This is as true today
as it was two centuries ago.  Contemporary bioethics
and classical medical ethics differ deeply on the mat-
ter of the ethics of sustaining hope. Bioethics has no
ethical principle of “respect for hope,” while classi-
cal medical ethics makes this principle central.
Bioethics centers on the principle of respect for
autonomy, reflecting its roots in the patient’s rights
era of the late 1960s. It was born in an era before the
connection between mind, emotions and body had
been explored, such that the importance of nurtur-
ing hope was not yet on the horizon of allopathic
medicine in the way that is was in other healing arts.
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Bioethics has much to learn from the perennial wis-
dom of medical ethics in regard to the principle of
respect for hope. On the other hand, hope ought not
to provide an excuse for deception and manipula-
tion, as was often so before patient autonomy came
to be taken seriously.   

Positive psychologists are now examining posi-
tive emotions, including hope, compassion, serenity,
and happiness, to better understand how these not
only provide a buffer against negative emotions, but
also have broader beneficial impacts on health. We
have arrived at a point where the study of hope and
health outcomes is credible. In this regard, the
Islamic tradition of medicine has much to offer. 

DDiissccuussssiioonn
JJuulliiee  BByyrrnnee,,  PPhhDD: Thank you so much, Dr. Frisina.

Thank you so much, Dr. Post. And thank all of you for
the privilege of being here. 

As I heard Dr. Post’s presentation my thoughts
are that you have a very difficult job concerning the
commitments and concerns of the Islamic Medical
Association and its interest in medical ethics. You
have a very difficult set of concerns that you try to
see through every day. Yet these are, as Dr. Post said,
some of the most important, not only medical but
also religious and human concerns that one could
have. I am someone who studies American religious
history, and from that perspective, I say that one of
the very difficult things that you face is that the con-
stituencies of the hospitals, the patients, and the col-
leagues with whom you work are from several ethnic
and religious backgrounds. I tell my students in
Religion 10, which is Introduction to Religion in
America, that in any job it is crucial for them to have
some kind of literacy about different religious tradi-
tions. We run through all of the ones that have
showed up in the United States over time and how
they get along, and how they do not get along, and
how wondrous it is to have a country where there
are so many religious traditions in contact and in
conversation with each other. If I tell my students in
Religion 10 that they need for their future jobs to
have a basic sense of religion in the United States
and how it works, how much more do you who are
on the frontlines of the entirety of the population
and its religious diversity at the most crucial
moments of people’s lives, where their bodies, spir-
its, and minds are in a crisis moment trying to relate

to each other and to their families as they are going
through these experiences? I felt just as we were
talking that there is an incredible calling that you
are following and an incredible inherent difficulty,
namely to address people who are coming from the
different religious traditions. How could you know
enough? How could you ever get a sense? And one of
the great things about talking about compassionate
care is that it has a way of cutting through a great
number of religious traditions to get to some things
that people in crisis situations just need humanly.

The area of my particular expertise is American
Catholicism. The ways in which you all encounter
Catholicism in America are quite varied. I will say
something about them. One thing that has come up
in the discussion is just the way in which compas-
sionate care makes it less crucial to know that partic-
ular nuance of Hinduism, Buddhism, Catholicism, or
Lutheranism and instead get to what are human-to-
human contacts, day in and day out, that can defi-
nitely come from the wellspring of the Abrahamic
traditions and others, but might not need to get into
their specifics so much. That has been very informa-
tive to me.

In your professional lives, you encounter
Catholicism in your work areas in at least three ways,
and they are all very much imbued with implications
for health-care work, and they all relate to hope, to
different takes on hope, and what it means to hope.
We will talk more about that as we get in the discus-
sion later, but hope is, I think, very basically the
grounds for believing that something good may hap-
pen and what that ground is for different Catholics
in different places might be very different. When you
are talking about Catholicism you are talking about a
church that is incredibly centralized in the form of
its central organization in Rome but is global and
incredibly populist. Worldwide, one in six people are
Catholic. The United States, despite all of its religious
diversity, is still a country that weighs in at some-
where between 76 and 82% of its residents claiming
Christianity. Of those Christians, the largest
Christian body is Catholicism, which accounts for
one in four Americans.

Catholicism is a good example simply because it
is one of the most populous faiths, and because the
Christian tenor and perhaps the Catholic tenor of
United States approaches to medicine go far beyond
the influence of just the official Catholic Church
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positions. That is because the Catholic Church is so
organized, because it has incredible institutional
presence in the form of hospitals and its health-care
system, and because of its government contracts and
its national lobbying arm and international influen-
tial presence. For all of these reasons Catholicism is
one good way to illustrate the incredible diversity
about the approaches to health care that might be
even within one tradition. I think the most visible
Catholic viewpoint is the one that comes from its
leaders, especially the bishops and backed up by the
Vatican.  It is a very visible take on health care,
which since the 1960s has emphasized more and
more what Cardinal Joseph Bernardin, who was
dying of cancer, came to call in his book The
Consistent Ethic of Life.a This consistent ethic of life
was Bernardin’s way of pulling together a number of
Catholic social and moral teachings that included life
issues and other issues. It also included that the
Catholic church is visibly and officially against abor-
tion, euthanasia, the death penalty, war and nuclear
armament, artificial birth control, and torture. All of
these were an encompassing set of positions that
included end-of-life issues about which medical
ethics are concerned. To put it more positively, this
is an array of issues that the Catholic church has spo-
ken consistently for in terms of many social justice
issues, antipoverty programs, human rights, and
antideath penalty in so far as they were putting for-
ward officially and programmatically a stance
against what Pope John Paul II called the culture of
death. That was the Catholic church’s modern and
perhaps postmodern response to what is sensed as
an ongoing devaluation of human life, and that it was
important to take a stand against it. This is the most
visible Catholic church stance from the bishops,
from Rome on controversial topics such as abortion
and birth control. This stance can be significantly
politicized, for example the prolife lionization of
Terri Schaivo’s family for keeping her on feeding
tube through many years, and it can also have anoth-
er aspect that is perhaps exemplified in the very
moving story of Cardinal Joseph Bernardin’s death
and the acceptance of life in whatever form it takes
as death approaches. This is the official set of posi-
tions.

What I think is the second most visible, and per-
haps most visible to you as physicians, is what
Nicholas Kristof wrote in a New York Times editorial

recently that there are two Catholic churches. One is
the official Catholic church, that is the bishops and
the pope with many pronouncements, and then
there is the other Catholic church, which runs hospi-
tals and does poverty work, and its many orders of
sisters, brothers, worker priests, and people who are
in the trenches. These are the people with whom you
work all the time in the Catholic hospital system.
They have different views than the official Vatican
positions. One can see this very explicitly, most
recently when there were Catholic talks on the
Obama health care plan. The Catholic bishops’ con-
ference came out with one stance, and the Catholic
nuns’ group came out with another. These were
opposite stands: for and against. This is where I see
the most of what Dr. Post was describing in the flour-
ishing and robust compassionate care tradition,
whether it is about end-of-life issues, care of the
mentally ill, or care of those who are disabled or on
the margins of life. Perhaps the most clear example
of this, from the Abrahamic traditions valuing life in
a very practical way no matter what the state of that
life comes in, is a group that Dr. Post mentioned, the
Arche community and the Arche homes, founded by
Jean Vanier. I think there are about 16 such homes in
the United States and more in Canada. In these
homes, people who are disabled and people who take
care of them live in home as a community with the
intent that this is a model or a microcosm of the
overall community. There is much to learn about life
in its supposedly diminished forms for those who are
supposedly not diminished. This cooperation and
synchronicity between those “disabled” and “able
bodied” exemplified and learned in the Arche homes
is seen in many other forms in a second tier of
Catholic approaches on how to care in hospitals.

Then there is a third group of Catholics with
whom you come in contact all the time, that is
patients and coworkers who are Catholic or come
from Catholic backgrounds. As I mentioned before,
25% of Americans call themselves Catholic. There
was a study a few years ago that showed if you count-
ed ex-Catholicism as a religious group, it, at 11%,
would be the third largest group in the United States,
following the Roman Catholics at 25% and the
Baptists at 16%.  People who are Catholic or are from
Catholic backgrounds are quite variable as to
whether they buy much, any, or all of the official
Vatican pronouncements. For example, only 11% of
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American Roman Catholics believe that abortion is
wrong in all circumstances, despite the official posi-
tion. In 2005, 25% of Catholics believed that you
could be a good Catholic even if you did not believe
Jesus rose from the dead physically. Seventy-six per-
cent believed that you could be a good Catholic even
if you did not go to Church every Sunday. What was
the other very characteristically American pluralis-
tic statistic? In 2003, 86% of Catholics agreed with
the statement, somewhat or strongly, that if you
believe in God, it does not really matter what reli-
gion you belong to. Therefore, what makes your
position so hard is that any Catholic you encounter
could be in a range of identification with Catholicism
that might be all over the map. Is this a Catholic who
believes the Vatican statements 100%, lives his or
her life by them, wants the end-of-life sacrament
according to the book from a priest, preferably in
Latin? Or are you talking to one of the 19% of Roman
Catholics who believe in reincarnation, clearly not a
Catholic belief, but one that is so much in the air in a
country that has Eastern religious ideas available
and popular that 19% of Roman Catholics believe
they are going to come back in another life someday,
as Hindus and Buddhists do.  This is a very challeng-
ing scene in which to make assumptions about the
beliefs of any particular Catholic colleague or
patient.

At the same time, there is a sketching of the
range of the official position, the social justice tradi-
tion and the incredible plurality of actual individual
Catholics. However, compassionate care, the kind of
compassionate care that is human, should be offered
regardless of these beliefs. Your religious back-
ground and other person’s background, are to some
extent minimized and relativized in the face of a sit-
uation where compassionate care can do the work.
Thank you.

DDrr..  WWaarrrreenn  FFrriissiinnaa’’ss  ccoommmmeenntt: It struck me lis-
tening to both Professor Post’s and  Professor
Byrne‘s presentations that it is clear that we live in
an age when the issues are so complicated, and the
problems are so severe, while the modes of commu-
nication are so limited, even as they are profusely
abounding. The tendency when talking about reli-
gion is to grasp for some thing, and typically that
means identifying a religious tradition with some lit-
tle facet, some little corner of what it is, and then
using that as the defining, essential characteristic.

Everything else you say works off of that. One of the
things that happens if you hang around a religious
scholar is that it becomes clear as you listen, for
them, the things we talk about as Islam, Christianity,
Catholicism, Buddhism, and Hinduism are the terms
that actually dissolve as we look more closely at peo-
ple’s lives and practices. They dissolve because they
do not say anything by themselves. You have to
know, as professor Byrne was just suggesting, what is
the context, what is the activity, what are the sub-
groups, what are the ways in which this person lives
a life influenced by Catholic tradition but also influ-
enced by other kinds of things? You know you just
have to turn the radio on for 30 seconds and hear
someone announcing or pronouncing something
about a tradition and then going to denounce that
thing. They have no idea what they are talking about
or who they are describing. Everyone knows that
from inside their own tradition. Muslims know the
ways in which Islam is complicated and sophisticat-
ed and spread out over all these  historical and geo-
graphical places and instantiated in different ways. It
is true also for the Catholics that Professor Byrne is
talking about.  I want to bring that observation
together with Professor Post’s presentation. Because
it is in listening to somebody before you move ahead
to draw conclusions about how to respond that you
find out what kind of Catholic is in front of you, or
what kind of Muslim you face, what is his or her
frame of reference is, and, as a result, you are able to
respond in the ways that are most helpful and most
likely to contribute to healing. The two talks for me
brought these things together. On the one hand, the
ethics of care, which requires an ability to listen, is
what will reveal to us, all of us, not just physicians,
who are the people we are working with, interacting
with, and dealing with.  It also helps us to step away
from the abstractions and get to the concrete reali-
ties. 

The question I wanted to start with, Professor
Post, is why is there a focus on the Abrahamic faiths?
I took it that you were juxtaposing those with the
enlightenment traditions’ understanding of ethics. I
wanted you to reflect a little bit on the extent to
which the things you were pointing to are usually
core to many religious traditions, whether or not
Abrahamic. The obvious example is Buddhism,
which is centered on the value of compassion, its
core value. In the Confucian tradition, as I under-
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stand it, they understand that what roots humans is
“ritual,” which you could translate quite easily into
“ethics” or “etiquette.” Dr. Post, could you talk about
the ways in which these values are rooted in reli-
gious traditions and use that as a way to think more
broadly about what the different religions’ roles are
in healing and in helping physicians to achieve their
tasks?

DDrr..  PPoosstt: Indeed we can learn a lot from picking
up a text by, for example the Dalai Lama‘s Ethics in the
New Millennium.b It is all about compassion. In other
words, we need to get more basic about the connec-
tive tissue between human beings, which is the basis
of ethics. I have always rejected most of
Enlightenment ethics because it is so contractarian.
It says, ”Look, we are so self-interested individuals,
and we can agree on certain kinds of minimal
restraints.” The principle of “Do no harm,” while it is
important, is also trivial at a certain level. We can
agree on restraints with regard to want and harm,
deception and the like so that we can live together
well in our self-interested ways. Of course, as soon as
one is adequately incentivized, greed takes over,
convenient restraints are set aside, unless you have
something deeper, which is where we get to the
Islamic tradition and the Buddhist tradition and so
forth. Unless you have some kind of connective glue
between human beings as the sort of ontology of
moral life, you are really out of luck and out of ethics.
At some point you can be one with others because
you believe in an all compassionate God, Allah, and
you believe we are all the children of that
Compassionate, Merciful God. As a panthiest, you
can believe that we are all one because somehow God
is alive in the molecular bonds in whatever way you
want to look at it. Not a silly idea, because the famous
Michael Sinmorly actually believed that you could
not explain H2O without the power of a transcendent
presence. Now maybe we are talking about mirror
neurons in both sides of the brain that allow us to
empathize or feel into the experience of others,
which is deeper than sympathy.  There is a whole
neurology of group selection. 

In the Journal of American Medical Association
not too long ago, Paul Ekman wrote an article on
Darwin and compassion based on Darwin’s book The
Descent of Man, and Selection in Relation to Sex, which
was published 11 years prior to his death. Darwin
thought that in fact individual selection theory, ”me

versus you” versus some desired object in the envi-
ronment, is mostly mistaken. However, most evolu-
tion actually occurs between groups. Group A will do
better than group B to the extent that group A devel-
ops within itself certain cohesive qualities such as
altruism, compassionate care, helpfulness, and the
like. In fact, Darwin even speculated briefly that we
ought to have built-in health benefits when we
engage in those kinds of activities.c That is why I am
not surprised to read studies out of the National
Institutes of Health (NIH) or proceedings of the
National Academy of Sciences showing that when
people are even thinking about making a contribu-
tion to charity, for example, the mesolimbic pathway
lights up.d This pathway is associated with feelings
of joy and the doling out of feel-good chemicals,
including dopamine and serotonin, one of which is
used to treat depression.  That is a bit of a natural law
argument. My point is, whatever the connective glue
is, you know we need it. The religions of the world, in
one way or another, enforce that. They teach us that
we are not as separate as we think we are, even as we
live separately. In a clinical environment, where we
train medical students to approach a patient only as
a biological object and not with any concern for the
subjectivity of it all, we are really limiting our oppor-
tunity to be healers.

QQuueessttiioonnss  ffrroomm  tthhee  aauuddiieennccee
DDrr..  FFrreedd  SSmmiitthh::  I just want to be a little contrarian. I

grew up in an evangelical tradition in which certainty was
very important, and I think it is a problem in our political
life today. My relatives and others in the hinterland believe
they have that certainty.  I think we have to be careful as
religious people not to be triumphalists. I do not want to
belittle secular or Kantian ethics because I do ethics con-
sultations and I would be lost without them. I cannot speak
in religious language when I do ethics consultation; I have
to speak in a language that everybody, including many
nonreligious people, which doctors often are, can under-
stand and appreciate. Besides, those four normative prin-
ciples help me in my thinking. I think we could argue that
paternalism and patriarchal society are sort of an
Abrahamic tradition in some ways, correct? As a
Protestant, one of the few here, I imagine, I do value the
Enlightenment. I think autonomy grew out of the idea that
the individual has a big role, and the hierarchy is not the
sole repository of truth and that we can individually find
the truth.
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As far as hope, the subject of today, and how it relates
to this uncertainty I think we all die alone in a sense. We
die, hopefully, with our family around us, which is the
point I made yesterday in trying to argue for dying with
hospice so that you can have people holding your hand.
But you die alone. I remember a number of years ago,
maybe in the last decade or so, something in the “New York
Times” struck me. The Archbishop of Paris was talking
about Pope John Paul II's declining health, and how he
would soon face the void. It really struck me that the Pope
was facing the void. The New Testament says that no man
has seen God at any time. I guess Moses got a glimpse at his
back. Elijah heard the small voice. Jesus certainly claimed
to have a direct relation, but we have not. When we die,
there is uncertainty. We hope that something good will
happen after we die, but we cannot be certain. I just want
really to caution, certainly from my tradition, and I think
the lessons I learned from it, the  necessary rebellion. Let us
not be triumphalist about our religious values. I agree with
everything you said, Dr. Post, about what we need to do,
but I think we need to see it more as “let us not,” as I said
yesterday. Some of the noblest, most righteous people with
the best etiquette I know are atheists. We have to work
together in our society today. We cannot separate our-
selves from those who do not have religion.

DDrr..  PPoosstt’’ss  rreessppoonnssee::  That is a great comment.
Thank you, Dr. Smith. It is not that the four princi-
ples are irrelevant. I carry them around. I do clinical
consults all the time. They are useful, minimize
harm, show concern about the patient’s good,
respect autonomy, and the like. These things matter,
and we should have that kind of common frame-
work. But let us recognize, too, that the
Enlightenment was highly theoretical. I mean
whether you are Utilitarian or Kantian, you are com-
ing up with some theory up here, and you are doing
applied ethics. You are applying some theory to real-
ity, but you know reality is too complex for that. I
remember back in my Chicago days, being a
teacher’s assistant to Stephen Toolman when he was
doing his course on the abuse of casuistry. But casu-
istry, which is more the traditional medical
approach of medical ethics, is basically comparing
cases. We know about this case, and that is how we
resolved it. Here’s another case. What are the conti-
nuities and differences? In fact, cognitive science
now is very clear that the moral mind does not work
deductively from principles and theories, but ana-
logically. We generally reason ethically in the same

way that a child learns about the color yellow. There
is a yellow banana on the table, a yellow piece of
paper, and a yellow teddy bear, and suddenly the kid
realizes “ahhh, yellow.” So casuistry is really impor-
tant. It does not mean that the principles are irrele-
vant. They are good things to have around, but they
do not do that much work. Similarly the ethics of
compassionate care focuses much more on the
details of the case. You know the other night I was in
New York listening to Peter Singer and Dinesh
D’Souza having a debate at the Socrates in the City
program. Peter Singer, in a conversation with Eva
Feder Kittay, who was a great ethicist of care, a fem-
inist. Eva had been for many years taking care of her
daughter, Sesha, who has severe cognitive disabili-
ties. After this debate, Eva asked Peter, who would
essentially dispatch children with cognitive disabili-
ties into the waste basket, parents willing, if he
would go with her to visit Sesha so that he could see
their relationship and understand that life is not just
about hypercognitive values, but also about emotion,
relationship, and love. Peter Singer said that he
would have nothing to learn from such an
encounter. What I am saying is that the highly theo-
retical approach does not do much work in the real
world. It is nice to have those principles around and,
of course, we want to respect autonomy, but on the
other hand in the process what have we done? We
have actually vilified hope. If you look at the modern
medical ethics literature, hope is essentially the vil-
lain; it is something that is abused, that is used to
manipulate, and of course sometimes it has been
abused. To recognize that  ethics has to be rooted not
in abstraction, but in a healing relationship, I think it
is the key. Autonomy is important, and, in the heel of
the hunt, every patient has the legal and ethical
right to make his or her own decision. Willard Galan
and Bruce Jennings wrote the book The Perversion of
Autonomy 15 years ago.e Charles Foster wrote The
Tyranny of Autonomy in 2009 and said we were aban-
doning people in the name of autonomy.f Edmund D.
Pellegrino wrote a book about this. It is so true. How
many clinicians do I know who, in order to be so-
called ethically right, will give patients a laundry list
of things? Well would you like this, this, this, check
A, B, C, and, of course, there is no conversation; the
physicians do not even make a recommendation. The
patient wants a recommendation. They would ask
what would you do if I were your brother? They want
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some guidance. They say you are the professional,
you have the knowledge, at least tell me what you
are thinking. The whole thing of autonomy is
overblown, and most of medical ethics, even in the
standard sort of clinical ethical literature has slid
back to a more negotiated dynamic between physi-
cian and patient. I think there are a lot of  problems
with the Georgetown Four, which I will not go into
because it is a long conversation. Autonomy, yes, is
very important, but let me tell you we are missing a
lot of things, and we are certainly not recognizing
the core of all good moral living, which is respectful
compassion.

DDrr..  AAaassiimm  PPaaddeellaa: Professor Post this question is for
you. Thank you very much for your talk. I think it was very
illuminating. Like the last speaker, you spoke about, poten-
tially from what I understood, the idea that our religion in
the United States, or the inherited religion or religious tra-
dition, perhaps caused or at least influenced the ethics that
we see now. I think that something can be taught in many
different ways. Therefore, I want to ask you about what
Aristotle even spoke about, that is the idea of virtue ethics
encultured by emulation of a teacher. Maybe the issue is
not necessarily that society has moved away from religion,
because, in America, many people say they are religious in
some sort of way. Rather, we have lost the mentor worthy
of emulation in medical education. So we do not have the
good physician. We have the physician who wants to make
his practice better by making more money. We do not have
the doctor who spends time. You mentioned a physician,
Dr. Foley, who makes spending time with the patient a pri-
ority, or those who keep their clinics open until 7 p.m. when
patients cannot come earlier.  We have an influx of private
practice physicians who get their training at the universi-
ties, where the emphasis is on mental and intellectual
quantification as opposed to caring for the patient.
Medicine used to be in many religious traditions. It has
moved away from that and is a totally different beast.
That is why I wanted you to comment on those two aspects. 

DDrr..  PPoosstt’’ss  rreessppoonnssee::  I think modeling and men-
toring is everything. I do not think it is adequately
rewarded in the health-care system today. Students
get out into the clerkship environments, and they
can see very wonderful models such as Dr. Foley. On
the other hand, they report the most horrendous
things imaginable. The doctor who comes in, spends
two minutes disrespectfully with the patient, and
then says, “Well I hope you get better. I have to go
golfing.” I mean this happens. Modeling is key, and

the Aristotelian tradition is 100% correct about this.
All of the great moral traditions, and not just the reli-
gious ones you know, but all of them understand.
John Dewey understood this, and he was a secularist.
It is all about passing the torch; it is  about my
accepting the fact that I am supposed to be a model,
a pay-it-forward as the common culture goes. Do not
worry about tit-for-tat, about payback, just take
delight in your life because you are a model of a cer-
tain kind of behavior for others. You do not know
how that will affect people down the road. You have
no idea, you will probably never see it, but you take
joy in simply knowing that you have contributed
that kind of a dynamic. Our physicians need to
accept the fact that they are models, and they have
forgotten that in many contexts. Certainly I agree
with that. I think the way people are focusing on eco-
nomic goals to the exclusion of the real core of the
healing art is a serious problem. That is why I try to
present some slides indicating that, in fact, if you
really look at it from a cost-efficiency basis, there is
an awful lot to be said for a healing relationship as
economically solvent. 

DDrr..  MMaammddoouuhh  FFaarriidd: First, I would like to say that the
presentation was excellent. I have two short comments and
one question. First, many of the studies Dr. Post mentioned
are correlation studies or cause and effect that I did not see
because you used the term “related to.” We definitely did
not know, for example, that a patient's hostility is related
to the rate of recovery or the rate of recovery is affected by
patient hostility. The second question is about teaching
compassion and empathizing with the patient. You talk
about role modeling, but you show us a lot of evidence in
terms of studies again. What about information on chang-
ing behaviors? Is this information given to new doctors in
a way that convinces them that they have to change the
behavior because it will result in less effort. My question,
actually, is how these principles relate to the ranking or
the rating of hospitals because they will not change if they
do not have something that affects their rating. Thank you.

DDrr..  PPoosstt’’ss  rreessppoonnssee:: It does affect ratings, in fact
it affects hospital ratings a lot. Long Island Jewish
Hospital has an interesting program. When it hires
anybody, it is my understanding, whether it is the
valet or the cook or the doctor or the nurse, they
actually get together in the same orientation meet-
ing, and the chief executive officer (CEO) talks to
them about the importance of a seamless culture of
compassionate care and medical etiquette. It is
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tremendously beneficial. If you look around the coun-
try, Stony Brook has a cancer center, but it is compet-
ing against Sloan Kettering now. I am assured that
you know the entity that has this dynamic of care will
thrive. In today's day and age of patient-centered
care, if you lack these assets, you will not thrive. This
is true, and it is very Darwinian. I think we are begin-
ning to understand that. CEOs everywhere around the
country in hospital systems are emphasizing patient-
centered compassionate care. They are doing lots of
training in these areas with staff at every possible
level. In terms of how you educate students, you
know there is exhortation.  You can talk about the
noble purposes of the profession, and you can bring
science to it. Some of it is correlates, and some of it is
cause and effect. Just like you could bring science into
a talk about depression for example, it is nice to be
able to bring science into talks about compassion and
altruism. I love the study about cause and effect. For
example, David McLowen’s study at Harvard called
“The Mother Teresa effect.”g He took Harvard under-
graduates and had them watch two movies.  One
group watched a movie about Mother Teresa helping
people in Calcutta; the controls watched an emotion-
ally neutral movie. The students who saw mother
Teresa showed elevated levels of gamma globulin A in
their saliva, which is a standard test of the strength of
the immune system. Then McLelan, who was the
greatest psychologist of his generation, divided the
subject group in two. He had half of the group medi-
tate, or visualize, or just imagine deeply giving warm-
ly toward others, and they continued with the spike
in salivary gamma globulin A. The group that did not
go through that internal exercise decreased to base-
line. That is cause and effect; it is an intervention
study. If you bring up the science, but even then I
acknowledge what was said earlier from this gentle-
man here that you know the science. I like the sci-
ence, but it is limited.

In the end, it is role modeling. In the end, I mean
we all have to look back on our lives and say to our-
selves, thank heavens there were these three or four.
Maybe if we are really lucky two or three dozen peo-
ple we have known in our lives really exemplified
compassionate care. We can remember the details. It
is like Joe Martin remembering the details of what Joe
Foley did for that woman: “I’d like some iced tea.” He
cannot forget that; he will never forget that. So that is
what I mean. We do what we see, and I think that is

the key issue here. It is the absence of compassionate
care and treating patients like they are simply biolog-
ical slabs that is so destructive for the patients and for
the healing professions. 

DDrr..  SSeelleeeemm  KKhhaann::  Thank you very much. I am a child
psychiatrist from Delaware. First, a comment. Once, in the
early years of his papacy, Pope John Paul II, was attending
Special Olympics. I still remember his comments, which
goes back to 30 some years. He said, “The greatness of a
nation is judged by the way it treats its most disadvan-
taged.” Any medical student over the centuries, if you ever
ask, or asked, why are you joining this profession, the
answer would be the same: “Because I want to help those
disadvantaged people who are in need.” All that was dis-
cussed earlier, and all the nice advice that we heard, if we
all can just remember that and why we joined this profes-
sion, then we will do things properly, irrespective of who we
are treating and which religion they observe. Having said
that comment, my very specific question, which is very dif-
ferent, is for Dr. Byrne. My understanding is that when it
comes to reward and punishment, pretty much all religions
are similar, at least the Abrahamic faiths, and over the
years with 30 years as a child psychiatrist I have been con-
fused about one issue. I ask teenagers who are pregnant and
come to me what their options are. I can count on fingers
how many of them said that they would opt for abortion. As
you know, punishment consequences for premarital sex and
abortion, according to many religious traditions, are pretty
much close to each other. What happened in our culture in
the United States? Premarital sex now seems like no big
deal.  I have teenagers, even boys, who say, “Oh it is like just
eating carrots.”On the other hand, you know when it comes
to abortion, I honestly thought, coming from a different cul-
ture, that almost every girl would be saying “I will just go
for abortion.” It is much more common attitude in other
cultures that I know, so I would like your comments as a
researcher.

DDrr..  BByyrrnnee’’ss  rreessppoonnssee: I am not sure that there has
been in the course of American religious history. The
way the story is usually told is that there were the
Puritans, and nobody had extramarital or premarital
sex. Then there was a long decline of morals, culmi-
nating in the 1960s when all morals went out the win-
dow and extramarital and premarital sex became
actually a positive value. Then came the backlash in
the 70s, 80s, 90s with the religious right and reining it
all in. I am honestly not sure that that is a historical-
ly accurate description of the trajectory of sexual
morals, and it is likely, according to historians and
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scholars, that the more accurate story is that there
has always been extramarital sex, premarital sex,
that it has always been inveighed against by the reli-
gious forces for the building up of a conservative or
ideal social space, and that the only thing really that
has varied is the permissibility of contrast with those
religious voices. I am not sure there has been what
scholars call history of decline. It is definitely the
case that religious and moral commentators in the
United States have always created a narrative of con-
stant decline, usually to try to get people back on the
right track. That is my short answer to a very, very
complicated question. Thank you so much. 

DDrr..  FFrriissiinnaa::  When Professor Varisco asked me to
put this panel together I knew fairly quickly that
these two folks would give you outstanding presen-
tations. My expectations have been fulfilled, and I
would just simply like to end by asking you all to join
me in thanking Professor Post and Professor Byrne
for their presentations. 

EEddiittoorr’’ss  NNootteess
a. Bernardin J, Feuchtmann TG. Consistent ethic of

life. Kansas City, MO: Sheed & Ward; 1988. 
b. Dalai Lama XIV. Ancient wisdom, modern world:
ethics for a new millennium. London: Abacus; 2001.
c. Ekman P. Darwin’s compassionate view of human
nature. JAMA. 2010 Feb 10;303:557-8.
http://dx.doi.org/10.1001/jama.2010.101
d. Moll J, Krueger F, Zahn R, et al. Human fron-
to–mesolimbic networks guide decisions about char-
itable donation. Proc Natl Acad Sci U S A.
2006;103:15623-8. http://doi.org/hfm
e. Gaylin W, Jennings B. The perversion of autonomy:
the proper uses of coercion and constraints in a lib-
eral society. New York: Free Press; 1996.
f. Foster C. Choosing life, choosing death: the tyran-
ny of autonomy in medical ethics and law. Oxford:
Hart Pub.; 2009.
g. McClelland D, Kirchnit C. The effect of motivation-
al arousal through films on salivary immunoglobulin
A. Psychology & Health.1988;2:31-52.
http://dx.doi.org/10.1080/08870448808400343

http://dx.doi.org/10.1080/08870448808400343
http://doi.org/hfm
http://dx.doi.org/10.1001/jama.2010.101



